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The paper contributes to the literature on the contribution of human capital to economic growth 
(see, e.g., Bailyet al. 2021), using recent developments in understanding its heterogeneity 
(Lagakoset al. 2006). Specifically, the paper focuses on the decomposition of the repeated cross-
sectional and age-earnings data of wages into experience, cohort, and time contributions (ECT). 
The experience effect captures human capital accumulation over the life cycle, the cohort effect 
captures inter-productivity growth (relative human capital level of a cohort of workers at the time 
when they enter the labor market), and the time effect captures changes in the rental price of 
human capital. 
 
The literature on the impact of human capital on growth is huge. It uses multiple concepts of 
human capital, mostly related to returns to education, which traces back to the Mincer equation. 
The impact of human capital on growth is heterogeneous and depends not only on demographic 
patterns and educational attainment but also on differences in productivity of different 
generations (cohorts) and patterns of experience accumulation.  
 
Explaining differences in growth between the United States and China, Fang and Qiu (2021) 
compare the composition of human capital contribution. They suggest a framework, which 
combines the ECT approach with a simple growth accounting framework (e.g. Fernald 
2014).They show that the age-specific earnings grew drastically in China, but stayed almost 
stagnant in the United States. They find also that the cohort remains stagnant in the United 
States, but starts growing with generations of Chinese workers, who entered the labor market 
since the late 1970s, the beginning of a gradual transition from plan to market, it is interesting to 
look at a similar decomposition of another large post-socialist economy, Russia. 
We use data from the RLMS-HSE household survey covering 2000-2019 years and apply a 
procedure suggested by Lagakos et.al. (2018) to disentangle the EPC effects. Then, using basic 
growth accounting framework (e.g. Fernald 2014) and Russia KLEMS data we calculate 
contributions of each of these effects to Russian growth. Our study could shed new light on the 
nature of the transformational recession, differences in the impact of gradual (China) and shock 
therapy transition (Russia), and the role of institutions in the process of experience accumulation. 
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